
The Asset Manager solution is the most
comprehensive enterprise solution for those seeking to track their assets
from cradle to grave. First and foremost the application resides in the
cloud so there’s no additional PC hardware requirements, messy cd’s, or
software updates to be concerned with. Being cloud based provides easy
access to your data from anywhere in the world, providing an internet
connection exists. This includes today’s common smart phones or tablet
computers. Above and beyond the traditional asset management
functionality, we also include inventory and service modules for tracking
maintenance and other inventory activities. We provide clients with many
views of their data, such as maps, an elegant dashboard, or traditional text
based views. Furthermore our Alerts engine provides various alerts based
on real time hardware, events, or date based triggers. Lastly, Asset
Manager includes a report writer so anyone can create a custom report
without the need of an IT person.

RTLS Module
RTLS provides real time Location of your assets and/or personnel. When
you combine this functionality with support for passive and active RFID
technology, you get a highly advanced tracking system that literally tells
you in real time where your assets are positioned on a map, tells you when
each asset moves, and can even tell you the temperature in the
environment.

Industry Vertical Modules
RFID Asset Manager has industry specific modules designed and customized
for your specific industry requirement. These modules provide support for
the following industries:

RFID Asset Manager

Products

Oil & Gas Fire Departments EMS Tracking

IT Assets Construction Equipment Rental Tracking

Art Tracking Tool Crib Mobile Fleet

Healthcare Employee Tracking

Dash Board View

Track Assets and People in a facility

View Assets on Google Maps

Use mobile and fixed readers


